2003 Fall Sale

Hip Name Price Buyer
1 Java Spice $10,000.00 Kilpak Tom
2 Lady Greenock $500.00 Truax Richard
3 Real Nice Philly $8,000.00 Johnson Dennis
4 Leslie Baba RNA
5 Loveitch $700.00 Stivers Bill
6 Miss Lindsey Anne $1,200.00 Gilbert Harold
7 Moro Bucks $600.00 Kasprick Ed
8 Most Of It RNA
9 My Sunny Money $1,300.00 Stivers Bill
10 Nurse Me Too $500.00 Kasprick Ed
11 Queen Stalker/Liginsky $4,000.00 Ellison Ken
12 Show Popper $500.00 Gabriel Lance
13 Singing $500.00 Gabriel Lance
14 Sue's Affair $2,400.00 Windylea Farms
15 Hesluckytoo $7,500.00 Hunt Stables Inc.
16 Tempting Terry out
17 Terlingua Rose out
18 Trial Miss $900.00 Warner Martha
19 Tri Holly out
20 Valanella $9,200.00 Ellison Ken
21 Code Talkin Gal $13,500.00 Moss Maggie
22 Adara $2,300.00 Gibbons Mike
23 Brennie Kirk $900.00 Claghorn Alan
24 Cheese Grits $1,000.00 Vanderpool Mike
25 Counselor's Row $900.00 Moler Bruce
26 Das Boat $1,200.00 Stivers Bill
27 Fastnfearless Baby no bid
28 Ferme Nueve RNA
29 Frog Town $600.00 Kasprick Ed
30 Geenarita $900.00 Windylea Farms
31 Give Me The OK $500.00 North Alexander Lyn
32 2003 Honkytonk Holly/Cape Storm RNA
33 Kellies Affair no bid
34 Luke is Cool out
35 2001 Moro Bucks/Mercedes Won RNA
36 Featured Storm $500.00 Truax Richard
37 Psychokinetic $500.00 Truax Richard
38 Jaw Breaker Babe out
39 Devoted Valance $500.00 Carden KC
40 2001Yes Oh Yes/Ghazi out
41 A Boy Named Luke out
42 Givemeasecondchance out
43 Geenarita/Farragut RNA
44 Gold Mercedes RNA
45 2001 Hard Liquor/Quaker Hill RNA
46 Holly Cat $1,600.00 Chleborad Lynn __|yearling
47 Medevil Mercedes RNA
48 Kyle's Darlin $5,000.00 Chleborad Lynn yearling
49 Eyes Rite out
50 Bonnie Blue Star RNA




51 Tiger Lad RNA

52 Red Hot Roxie $1,100.00 Moss Maggi

53 Brysons Bullet $1,200.00 McShane Dave
54 Little Affair $1,000.00 Prairie Lane Farms
55 Kyle's Breeze $800.00 McClelland Barbara
56 Court Ordered $20,000.00 Olson Rick

57 Charming Janie RNA

58 Our Gaggy/Sharkey RNA

59 Roys Lady Danseur $7,500.00 Don Frazier

60 Stephaniestride RNA

61 Invading Rebe RNA

62 Charm Yu RNA

63 Barticus $600.00 Mihalevich Melissa
64 Psy Ops no bid

65 Garden Hostess $500.00 Kirkpatrick Joy
66 Ready Ready Run Run $2,500.00 Prairie Lane Farms
67 | 2002 Stalk Lake Dancer/Louis Quatorze RNA

68 Sexy P M $11,000.00 | DeBruycker Lloyd
69 Cheer Girl $10,500.00 Moss Maggi

70 Pixie Piper $1,200.00 Moss Maggi

71 Hi Ho Aggie $1,000.00 Moss Maggi

72 Grant's Farm $1,700.00 McGlothlen Keith
73 De Wishbone $1,000.00 Hodneifield Steve
74 Taro Tigress RNA

75 My last Mercedes RNA

76 Tellito McKenzie RNA

77 Looknforsumthinmor RNA

78 Hazardous Material RNA

79 02 Upatsix/Sandpit $7,000.00 Don Frazier

80 Our Lady Cassandra RNA

81 Playgirl Talk $500.00 Moss Maggi

82 Veishea Cronicals no bid

83 Back By Jake $1,200.00 Hammersmith DL
84 Thecaptainsgirl $18,000.00 Moss Maqggi

85 Clusette $900.00 Booker Hildric
86 Binnaroundtheblock $10,000.00 Don Frazier

87 Queansco $600.00 Hammersmith DL
88 Storm Wrangler $1,500.00 Sharpness Travis
89 Open Up Tiger $700.00 Young Nicole
90 Shawaf Talk RNA

91 Deb's Demise $4,200.00 VonHemel Kelly
92 Mercedes Secret RNA

93 Fancy Fluff $800.00 Clark Dick

94 Dance Me Around $600.00 Spech John

95 Infaust RNA

96 Peek ABool CU late vet out

97 Moonshineofthrills $25,000.00 | DeBruycker Lloyd
98 Chain Dancer $6,800.00 Juckette Linda
99 Fille's Won $2,500.00 Adams Charles Dr.
100 Justahamsandwich $3,700.00 Prairie Lane Farms
101 Mastercraft $2,000.00 Moss Maggi
102 Diplomatic Storm $800.00 Wandt/Zimmerman
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103 Kyle's Lad no bid
104 Cape on the Wire $1,500.00 Ingle Lynn
105 Our Incentive $6,500.00 Chleborad Lynn
106 Political Cyclone $500.00 Parisek Jerry
107 2002 Hasty Katy/Exclusivengagement RNA
108 Ima Fast Invader $700.00 Crossley Norman
109 Carolyns Courage $700.00 Derith Vogt
total sales $236,000.00 [67 sold
median $1,100.00 |32 n/s
average $3,522.00 |10 outs
Yearling Avg. $2,292.50
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